
Practical Queen Rearing: A Comprehensive
Guide to Raising Healthy, Productive Queens

In the realm of beekeeping, the queen bee reigns supreme. Her presence
ensures the vitality and productivity of a hive, as she is responsible for
laying the eggs that will produce future generations of workers and drones.
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For beekeepers who aspire to maintain thriving apiaries, the ability to rear
their own queens is an invaluable skill.
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"Practical Queen Rearing" by Walter T. Kelley is an indispensable resource
for beekeepers of all levels who seek to master the art of queen rearing.
This comprehensive guide provides a step-by-step approach to the entire
process, from selecting appropriate stock to installing newly mated queens.

Chapter 1: The Importance of Queen Rearing

Kelley begins by emphasizing the critical role that queens play in the health
and productivity of honey bee colonies. He explains how a well-bred queen
can lead to increased honey production, reduced swarming, and improved
resistance to pests and diseases.

Chapter 2: Selecting Stock for Queen Rearing

The selection of appropriate stock is paramount to successful queen
rearing. Kelley provides detailed guidance on evaluating queen mothers
based on factors such as egg-laying capacity, longevity, and colony
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performance. He also discusses the importance of genetic diversity and the
advantages of using reputable queen breeders.

Chapter 3: Establishing a Queen-Rearing Unit

To rear queens successfully, beekeepers need a dedicated queen-rearing
unit. Kelley provides instructions on setting up various types of queen-
rearing units, including the Jenter kit, the Alley method, and the Doolittle
method. He also covers the essential equipment and supplies required for
queen rearing.

Chapter 4: Making Artificial Swarms

Artificial swarming is a technique used to create a temporary queenless
colony that will produce a new queen. Kelley explains the different types of
artificial swarms, such as the shook swarm, the shook-swarm-and-virgin-
queen method, and the split colony method. He provides detailed
instructions on each method, ensuring that beekeepers can choose the
approach that best suits their needs.

Chapter 5: Grafting Larvae

Grafting larvae is the process of transferring young honey bee larvae from
donor hives to queen cells in the queen-rearing unit. Kelley provides a
thorough explanation of the grafting process, including the selection of
young larvae, the use of grafting tools, and the different grafting
techniques.

Chapter 6: Raising Queen Cells

Once the larvae have been grafted, they need to be properly raised and
cared for until they emerge as adult queens. Kelley covers the optimal



temperature, humidity, and ventilation conditions for queen cell
development. He also discusses the importance of providing adequate
nutrition and protecting the queen cells from predators.

Chapter 7: Introducing New Queens

Introducing a new queen into an existing hive requires careful preparation
and execution. Kelley provides detailed instructions on how to introduce
queens using various methods, such as the candy method, the newspaper
method, and the queen cage method. He emphasizes the importance of
properly preparing the hive and minimizing stress for the new queen.

Chapter 8: Selecting and Mating Queens

Before a new queen can begin laying eggs, she must be successfully
mated with a drone. Kelley explains the mating process and provides
practical advice on how to select the best drones for mating. He also
discusses the importance of using mating nucs and queen excluders to
ensure successful queen mating.

Chapter 9: Installing a New Queen

Installing a newly mated queen into a hive is a critical step in the queen-
rearing process. Kelley provides detailed instructions on how to install a
queen into a standard Langstroth hive or a top-bar hive. He covers the
importance of releasing the queen at the appropriate time and providing her
with support and protection until she has become accepted by the colony.

Chapter 10: Maintaining a Queen-Rearing Program

Queen rearing is an ongoing process that requires careful planning and
maintenance. Kelley provides guidance on establishing a successful



queen-rearing program that can meet the needs of the beekeeper and their
apiary. He discusses the importance of record-keeping, disease prevention,
and continuous improvement.

"Practical Queen Rearing" by Walter T. Kelley is an essential resource for
beekeepers who aspire to master the art of queen rearing. With its
comprehensive coverage of all aspects of the process, from selecting stock
to installing newly mated queens, this book provides beekeepers with the
knowledge and techniques they need to raise healthy, productive queens
that will ensure the success and longevity of their apiaries.
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